BID TAB FOR HIGHWAY SALT Bid No. 17-F-00013 Bid Opening Date May 3 2017 @ 3pm
VENDOR Douglas County Wakarusa Township Cit‘ of Ottawa City of Bal‘dwin Franklin County City of Lecompton City of Lawrence

Qty | $/Ton Qty | $/Ton Qty | $/Ton Qty | $/Ton Qty | $/Ton Qty |$/Ton Qty |$/Ton
Independent Salt 3000 No Bid 250 No Bid 300 No Bid 50 No Bid 800 No Bid 25 No Bid 3500 $52.46 $183,610.00
Hutchinson Salt Co, Inc | 3000] $49.10 $147,300.00] 250 | $55.10 $13,775.00] 300 | $53.00 $15,900.00] s0 | $54.75 $2,737.50] 800 | $54.50 $43,600.00] 25 $55.10 $1,377.50] 3500] $49.10 $171,850.00
Dale Brothers 3000| $63.00 $189,000.00{ 250 | $63.00 $15,750.00] 300 | $63.00 $18,900.00] 50 | $63.00 $3,150.00] 800 | $63.00 $50,400.00] 25 $63.00 $1,575.00] 3500] $63.00 $220,500.00
Commodities USA 3000 $107.00 $321,000.00] 250 |$107.00 $26,750.00] 300 |$107.00 $32,100.00] s0 |$107.00 $5,350.00] 800 |$107.00 $85,600.00] 25 |$107.00 $2,675.00] 3500| $107.00 $374,500.00
Cargill 3000 No Bid 250 No Bid 300 No Bid 50 No Bid 800 No Bid 25 No Bid 3500 No Bid
Central Salt 3000| $43.99 $131,970.00] 250 | $47.45 $11,862.50] 300 | $47.45 $14,235.00] s0 | $47.45 $2,372.50] 800 | $45.45 $36,360.00] 25 $47.45 $1,186.25] 3500 $43.99 $153,965.00
Compass Minerals 3000]$119.64 $358,920.00| 250 |$120.68 $30,170.00] 300 |$120.20 $36,060.00] 50 |$120.20 $6,010.00] 800 [$120.20 $96,160.00] 25 | $120.20 $3,005.00] 3500] $119.64 $418,740.00
Morton Salt 3000 No Bid 250 No Bid 300 No Bid 50 No Bid 800 No Bid 25 No Bid 3500 No Bid

3000 250 300 50 800 25 3500

3000 250 300 50 800 25 3500
Director of Public Works: Keith A. Browning County Clerk: Jamie Shew Date:
Laura Glass Heather Dill
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