
City Attorney’s Office   

•City Attorney’s Office / 
Prosecutors’ Office (1080) 
 
•Human Relations (1085) 
 

•Municipal Court (1090) 
 
  



1080 – City Attorney 

• City Attorney’s Office – 
the City’s lawyers  

 
• Prosecutors’ Office – the 

partners of law 
enforcement – prosecute 
municipal offenses.   



1085 – Human Relations 

• Staff of City Prosecutors’ 
Office investigates 
allegations of discrimination 
in housing, public 
accommodations, and 
employment in the City 
limits.   

• Staff educates the public on 
Chapter X of the City Code.  



1090 – Municipal Court 

The Municipal Court Judge, 
with administrative assistance 
from the court manager and 
court clerks, adjudicates 
alleged violations of the City 
Code in a fair and impartial 
manner.   
 
  



Municipal Court - 2014 

• 32,271 total citations 
(criminal, traffic, and NTA 
parking) 

• 94,390 parking meter 
citations 

 



Department’s Issues 

• Security for 1006 New 
Hampshire – Court / 
Prosecutors’ Offices 

• Additional staffing for City 
Prosecutors’ Office 

• Space needs at Municipal 
Court and City Prosecutors’ 
Office 
 
 
 

 



Department’s Issues 

• Exploring alternative 
measures to reduce the 
number of jail days served 
as a result of municipal 
court proceedings, while 
maintaining accountability 
and public safety.   
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