ORDINANCE NO. 8796
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF LAWRENCE, KANSAS, REPEALING EXISTING CHAPTER V, ARTICLE 5 OF THE CODE OF THE CITY OF LAWRENCE, 2011 EDITION, AND AMENDMENTS THERETO, REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 8585, AND ENACTING, IN THEIR PLACE, CHAPTER V, ARTICLE 5 OF THE CODE OF THE CITY OF LAWRENCE, KANSAS, 2011 EDITION, AND AMENDMENTS THERETO, WHICH ADOPTS AND INCORPORATES BY REFERENCE THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, REGULATING BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION WITHIN THE CITY OF LAWRENCE, KANSAS. 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF LAWRENCE, KANSAS:
SECTION 1. Existing Chapter V, Article 5, of the Code of the City of Lawrence, Kansas, 2011 Edition, and amendments thereto, and City of Lawrence, Kan., Ord. No. 8585 (Nov. 2, 2010), are hereby repealed in their entirety, it being the intent of the Governing Body that Section 2 of this Ordinance supersede them.
SECTION 2. The Code of the City of Lawrence, Kansas, 2011 Edition, and amendments thereto, is hereby amended by enacting Chapter V, Article 5, which reads as follows:

ARTICLE 5. PLUMBING CODE
5-501

PLUMBING CODE ADOPTED AND INCORPORATED.

The 2012 International Plumbing Code, published by the International Code Council, Inc., other than those portions hereinafter specifically deleted, modified, or amended, is hereby adopted as the City's Plumbing Code and is incorporated herein by reference as if set forth in full.

5-502

OFFICIAL COPY.
Not less than one (1) copy of the 2012 International Plumbing Code shall be marked or stamped "OFFICIAL COPY AS INCORPORATED BY ORDINANCE No. 8796," with all sections or portions deleted, modified, or amended clearly marked as such, and to which one (1) copy of this ordinance shall be affixed, shall be filed with the City Clerk, shall be open to inspection, and shall be available to the public during reasonable business hours. Additional official copies shall, at the cost of the City, be supplied to those officials and agencies charged with enforcement of the City's Plumbing Code.
5-503

AMENDMENTS TO THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE.

The 2012 International Plumbing Code is amended as set forth in the succeeding sections of this Article. These amendments shall not serve to delete, modify, or amend any discretely numbered section or subsection of the 2012 International Plumbing Code, unless the section or subsection is specifically identified as being deleted, modified, or amended.

5-504
CHAPTER 1, "SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION," of the 2012 International Plumbing Code is hereby deleted.
5-505

The 2012 International Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding Section 407.5, which reads as follows:

407.5 Prohibition. In no case shall bathtubs be installed head to head.
5-506
Table 605.3, "WATER SERVICE PIPE," of the 2012 International Plumbing Code is hereby amended to read as follows:


[image: image1.emf]MATERIAL STANDARD

Acrylonitrile butadiene styrene (ABS) plastic pipe ASTM D 1527; ASTM D 2282

Asbestos-cement pipe ASTM C 296

Brass pipe ASTM B 43

Chlorinated polyvinyl chloride (CPVC) plastic pipe ASTM D 2846; ASTM F 441; ASTM F 442; CSA B137.6

Copper or copper-alloy pipe ASTM B 42; ASTM B 302

Copper or copper-alloy tubing (Type K, WK, L, WL, M or ASTM B 75; ASTM B 88; ASTM B 251; ASTM B 447

WM)

Cross-linked polyethylene (PEX) plastic pipe and tubing ASTM F 876; ASTM F 877; AWWA C904; CSA B137.5

Cross-linked polyethylene/aluminum/cross-linked ASTM F 1281; CSA B137.10M

polyethylene  (PEX-AL-PEX) pipe

Cross-linked polyethylene/aluminum/high-density ASTM F 1986

polyethylene  (PEX-AL-HDPE)

Ductile iron water pipe AWWA C151; AWWA C115

Galvanized steel pipe ASTM A 53

Polyethylene (PE) plastic pipe

a

ASTM D 2239; ASTM D 3035; AWWA C901; CSA B137.1

Polyethylene (PE) plastic tubing

a

ASTM D 2737; AWWA C901; CSA B137.1

Polyethylene/aluminum/polethylene (PE-AL-PE) pipe

a

ASTM F 1282; CSA B137.9

Polyethylene of raisedtemperature (PE-RT) plastic tubingASTM F 2769

Polypropylene (PP) plastic pipe or tubing ASTM F 2389; CSA B137.11

Polyvinyl chloride (PVC) plastic pipe

a

ASTM D 1785; ASTM D 2241; ASTM D 2672; CSA

B137.3

Stainless steel pipe (Type 304/304L) ASTM A 312; ASTM A 778

Stainless steel pipe (Type 316/316L) ASTM A 312; ASTM A 778

TABLE 605.3

WATER SERVICE PIPE

a. Limited to the retrofitting of an existing lawn irrigation system, which was installed prior to August 1, 1992.


5-507
Table 605.4, "WATER DISTRIBUTION PIPE," of the 2012 International Plumbing Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

[image: image2.emf]MATERIAL STANDARD

Brass pipe ASTM B 43

Chlorinated polyvinyl chloride (CPVC) plastic pipe and tubing ASTM D 2846; ASTM F 441; ASTM F 442; CSA B137.6

Copper or copper-alloy pipe ASTM B 42; ASTM B 302

Copper or copper-alloy tubing (Type K, WK, L, WL, M or WM) ASTM B 75; ASTM B 88; ASTM B 251; ASTM B 447

Cross-linked polyethylene (PEX) plastic tubing ASTM F 876; ASTM F 877; CSA B137.5

Cross-linked polyethylene/aluminum/cross-linked ASTM F 1281; ASTM F 2262; CSA B137.10M

polyethylene  (PEX-AL-PEX) pipe

Cross-linked polyethylene/aluminum/high-density ASTM F 1986

polyethylene  (PEX-AL-HDPE)

Ductile iron pipe AWWA C151/A21.51; AWWAC115/A21.15

Galvanized steel pipe ASTM A 53

Polyethylene/aluminum/polethylene (PE-AL-PE) composite pipeASTM F 1282

Polyethylene of raised temperature (PE-RT) plastic tubing ASTM F 2769

Polypropylene (PP) plastic pipe or tubing ASTM F 2389; CSA B137.11

Stainless steel pipe (Type 304/304L) ASTM A 312; ASTM A 778

Stainless steel pipe (Type 316/316L) ASTM A 312; ASTM A 778

TABLE 605.4

WATER DISTRIBUTION PIPE


5-508
Section 708.3.5 of the 2012 International Plumbing Code is hereby amended to read as follows:


708.3.5 Building drain and building sewer junction. There shall be a cleanout near the junction of the building drain and the building sewer. The cleanout shall be either inside or outside the building wall and shall be brought up to the finished ground level or to the basement floor level. An approved two-way cleanout is allowed to be used at this location to serve as a required cleanout for both the building drain and building sewer. The cleanout at the junction of the building drain and building sewer shall not be required if the cleanout on a 3-inch (76 mm) or larger diameter soil stack is located within a developed length of 10 feet (3048 mm) of the building drain and building sewer connection. The minimum size of the cleanout at the junction of the building drain and building sewer shall comply with Section 708.7.
5-509
Section 710.1 of the 2012 International Plumbing Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
710.1 Maximum fixture unit load. The maximum number of drainage fixture units connected to a given size of building sewer, building drain or horizontal branch of the building drain shall be determined using Table 710.1(1); however no building sewer shall be less than four (4) inches in diameter. The maximum number of drainage fixture units connected to a given size of horizontal branch or vertical soil or waste stack shall be determined using Table 710.1(2).
5-510
The 2012 International Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding Section 906.6, which reads as follows:
906.6 Aggregate Size of Vents. The drainage piping of each building and each connection to a public sewer or a private sewage disposal system shall be vented by means of one or more vent pipes, the aggregate cross-sectional area of which shall not be less than that of the largest required building sewer, as determined from Table 710.1(1). Vent pipes from fixtures located upstream from pumps, ejectors, backwater valves, or other devices that in any way obstruct the free flow of air and other gases between the building sewer and the outside atmosphere shall not be used for meeting the cross-sectional area venting requirements of this section.
Exception: When connected to a common building sewer, the drainage piping of two (2) or more buildings located on the same lot and under one (1) ownership may be vented by means of piping sized in accordance with Table 710.1(1), provided the aggregate cross-sectional area of all vents is not less than that of the largest required common building sewer.

5-511
Sections 918.2, 918.3, and 918.8 of the 2012 International Plumbing Code are hereby amended to read as follows:
918.2 Installation. The valves shall only be installed with prior approval from the department having jurisdiction, in accordance with the requirements of this section, and in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions. Air admittance valves shall be installed after the DWV testing required by Section 312.2 or 312.3 has been performed.
918.3 Where permitted. The valves shall only be permitted in the alterations of existing buildings with prior approval from the department having jurisdiction. Individual, branch and circuit vents shall be permitted to terminate with a connection to an individual or branch-type air admittance valve in accordance with Section 918.3.1. Stack vents and vent stacks shall be permitted to terminate to stack-type air admittance valves in accordance with Section 918.3.1.

918.8 Prohibited installations. Air admittance valves shall not be installed in new construction and in non-neutralized special waste systems as described in Chapter 8 except where such valves are in compliance with ASSE 1049, are constructed of materials approved in accordance with Section 702.5 and are tested for chemical resistance in accordance with ASTM F 1412. Air admittance valves shall not be located in spaces utilized as supply or return air plenums. Air admittance valves without an engineered design shall not be utilized to vent sumps or tanks of any type.

Exception: Island fixtures in new construction may be vented by air admittance valves that comply with section 918.
SECTION 3. If any section, clause, sentence, or phrase of this ordinance is found to be unconstitutional or is otherwise held invalid by any court of competent jurisdiction, it shall not affect the validity of any remaining parts of this ordinance. 
SECTION 4.  After adoption and publication as provided by law, this ordinance shall be in full force and effect, commencing March 1, 2013.
ADOPTED by the Governing Body of the City of Lawrence, Kansas, this ____ day of December, 2012.

 APPROVED:

___________________________________

Robert J. Schumm

Mayor

ATTEST:

__________________________________

Jonathan M. Douglass

City Clerk
APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY:                    

__________________________________

Toni R. Wheeler

City Attorney

*****

NOTICE TO PUBLISHER

Publish one time and return one Proof of Publication to the City Clerk and one to the City Attorney.
1

_1415700844.xls
permit fee schedule

		

				2007 Permit Fee Schedule

				TOTAL VALUATION		FEE

				$1 to $500		$22.32

				$501 to $2,000		$22.32 for the first $500 plus 2.89 for each additional $100

						or fraction thereof, to and including $2,000

				$2,001 to $25,000		$65.78 for the first $2,000 plus $13.30 for each additional

						$1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including $25,000

				$25,001 to $50,000		$371.68 for the first $25,000 plus $9.59 for each additional

						$1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000

				$50,001 to $100,000		$611.56 for the first $50,000 plus $6.65 for each additional

						$1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including $100,000

				$100,001 to $500,000		$944.06 for the first $100,000 plus $5.32 for each additional

						$1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including $500,000

				$500,001 to $1,000,000		$3,072.06 for the first $500,000 plus $4.51 for each

						additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including

						$1,000,000

				$1,000,001 to $5,000,000		$5328.31 for the first $1,000,000 plus $2.99 for each

						additiohnal $1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including

						$5,000,000

				$5,000,001 to $15,000,000		$17,081.87 for the first $5,000,000 plus $1.46 for each

						additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including

						$15,000,000

				$15,000,001 and above		$31,884.18 for the first $15,000,000 plus $0.96 for each

						additional $1,000 or fraction thereof

				Other Inspections and Fees:

				(1) Inspections outside of normal business hours (minimum charges - two hours)            $47.00 per hour*

				(2) Re-inspection fees when assessed by the building official under the                          $47.00 per hour*

				provisions of Section 108.8

				(3) Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated (minimum charge -                      $47.00 per hour*

				one-half hour)

				(4) Additional plan review required by changes, additions, or revisions to                        $47.00 per hour

				approved plans (minimum charge - one-half hour)

				(5) Residential Furnaces and Air Conditioners (Effective July 1st 2007)                            $65.00

				*Or the total hourly cost to the jurisdiction, whichever is the greatest. This cost shall include supervision,

				overhead, equipment, hourly wages and fringe benefits of the employees involved.





IBC 2902.1

		No.		CLASSIFICATION		OCCUPANCY		DESCRIPTION		WATER CLOSETS e				LAVATORIES								OTHER

										(URINALS SEE SECTION

										419.2 OF THE										DRINKING FOUNTAINS f

										INTERNATIONAL										(SEE SECTION 410.1

										PLUMBING CODE)										OF THE

										MALE		FEMALE		MALE		FEMALE		BATHTUBS/		INTERNATIONAL

																		SHOWERS		PLUMBING CODE)

								Theaters and

								other buildings

								for the

						A-1d		performing arts		1 per 125		1 per 65		1 per 200				—		1 per 500		1 service sink

								and motion

								pictures

								Nightclubs, bars,

								taverns, dance

								halls and		1 per 40		1 per 40		1 per 75				—		1 per 500

								buildings for														1 service sink

						A-2d		similar purposes

								Restaurants,

								banquet halls		1 per 75		1 per 75		1 per 200				—		1 per 500

								and food courts

								Auditoriums

								without														1 service sink

								permanent

								seating, art

								galleries,		1 per 125		1 per 65		1 per 200				—		1 per 500

								exhibition halls,

								museums,

								lecture halls,														1 service sink

				Assembly				libraries, arcades

		1		(see Sections		A-3d		and gymnasiums

				2902.2, 2902.4				Passenger

				and 2902.4.1)				terminals and

								transportation		1 per 500		1 per 500		1 per 750				—		1 per 1,000

								facilities														1 service sink

								Places of

								worship and

								other religious		1 per 150		1 per 75		1 per 200				—		1 per 1,000

								services

								Coliseums,		1 per 75 for		1 per 40 for

								arenas, skating		the first		the first										1 service sink

								rinks, pools and		1,500 and		1,500 and

						A-4		tennis courts for		1 per 120		1 per 60

								indoor sporting		for the		for the		1 per 200		1 per 150		—		1 per 1,000

								events and		remainder		remainder

								activities		exceeding		exceeding

										1,500		1,500										1 service sink

								Stadiums,		1 per 75 for		1 per 40 for

								amusement		the first		the first

								parks, bleachers		1,500 and		1,500 and

								and grandstands		1 per 120		1 per 60

						A-5		for outdoor		for the		for the		1 per 200		1 per 150		—		1 per 1,000

								sporting events		remainder		remainder										1 service sink

								and activities		exceeding		exceeding

										1,500		1,500

								Buildings for

								the transaction

								of business,

								professional

				Business (see				services, other		1 per 25 for the first 50				1 per 40 for the first

		2		Sections 2902.2,		B		services		and 1 per 50 for the				80 and 1 per 80 for				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

				2902.4 and				involving		remainder exceeding 50				the remainder

				2902.4.1)				merchandise,						exceeding 80

								office buildings,

								banks, light

								industrial and

								similar uses

								Educational

		3		Educational		E		facilities		1 per 50				1 per 50				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

								Structures in

								which

								occupants are

								engaged in										See Section

		4		Factory and		F-1 and F-2		work		1 per 100				1 per 100				411 of the		1 per 400		1 service sink

				industrial				fabricating,										International

								assembly or										Plumbing

								processing of										Code

								products or										footnote g

								materials

								Residential

						I-1		care		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

								Hospitals,

								ambulatory

								nursing home		1 per per room c				1 per per room c				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

								patients b

								Employees,

						I-2		other than

								residential		1 per 25				1 per 35				—		1 per 100		—

								care b

		5		Institutional				Visitors, other

								than residential		1 per 75				1 per 100				—		1 per 500		—

								care

						I-3		Prisons b		1 per cell				1 per cell				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

								Reformatories,

								detention

						I-3		centers and		1 per 15				1 per 15				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

								correctional

								centers b

								Adult day care

						I-4		and child care		1 per 15				1 per 15				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

								Retail stores,

								service

				Mercantile (see				stations, shops

		6		Section 2902.2,		M		salesrooms,		1 per 500				1 per 750				—		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

				2902.4, 2902.4.1				markets and

				and 2902.4.2)				shopping

								centers

								Hotels, motels,

								boarding										1 per sleeping

						R-1		houses		1 per sleeping unit				1 per sleeping unit				unit		—		1 service sink

								(transient)

								Dormitories,

								fraternities,

						R-2		sororities and		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

								boarding house

		7		Residential				(not transient)

																						1 kitchen sink

																						per dwelling

																						unit; 1

																						automatic

						R-2		Apartment		1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling		—		clothes

								house										unit				washer

																						connection

																						per 20

																						dwelling units

																						1 kitchen sink

																						per dwelling

																						unit; 1

								One- and														automatic

						R-3		two-family		1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling		—		clothes

								dwellings										unit				washer

		7		Residential																		connection

																						per 20

																						dwelling units

								Residential

						R-4		care/assisted		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

								living facilities

								Structures for

								the storage of

				Storage (see				goods,										See Section

				Sections 2902.2,		S-1		warehouses,										411 of the

		8		2902.4 and		S-2		storehouses		1 per 100				1 per 100				International		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

				2902.4.1)				and freight										Plumbing

								depots, low										Code

								and moderate										footnote g

								hazard

		a.		The fixtures shown are based on one fixture being the minimum required for the number of persons indicated or any

				fraction of the number of persons indicated. The number of occupants shall be determined by this code.

		b.		Toilet facilities for employees shall be separate from facilities for inmates or patients.

		c.		A single-occupant toilet room with one water closet and one lavatory serving not more than two adjacent patient rooms

				shall be permitted where such room is provided with direct access from each patient room and with provisions for

				privacy.

		d.		The occupant load for seasonal outdoor seating and entertainment areas shall be included when determining the

				minimum number of facilities required.

		e.		In each bathroom or toilet room, urinals shall not be substituted for more than 67 percent of the required water closets

				in assembly and educational occupancies. Urinals shall not be substituted for more than 50 percent of the required water .

				closets in all other occupancies

		f.		Drinking fountains shall conform to ASME A112.19.1M, ASME A112.19.2M or ASME A112.19.9M and water coolers shall

				conform to ARI 1010. Drinking fountains and water coolers shall conform to NSF 61, Section 9. Where water is served in

				restaurants, drinking fountains shall not be required. In other occupancies, where drinking fountains are required, water coolers

				or bottled water dispensers shall be permitted to be substituted for not more than 50 percent of the required drinking fountains.

		g.		Emergency showers and eyewash stations shall conform to ISEA Z358.1. Waste connections shall not be required for emergency

				showers and eyewash stations.





IBC 2902.1 - 1

		

				No.		CLASSIFICATION		OCCUPANCY		DESCRIPTION		WATER CLOSETS e				LAVATORIES								OTHER

												(URINALS SEE SECTION

												419.2 OF THE										DRINKING FOUNTAINS f

												INTERNATIONAL										(SEE SECTION 410.1

												PLUMBING CODE)										OF THE

												MALE		FEMALE		MALE		FEMALE		BATHTUBS/		INTERNATIONAL

																				SHOWERS		PLUMBING CODE)

										Theaters and

										other buildings

										for the

								A-1d		performing arts		1 per 125		1 per 65		1 per 200				—		1 per 500		1 service sink

										and motion

										pictures

										Nightclubs, bars,

										taverns, dance

										halls and		1 per 40		1 per 40		1 per 75				—		1 per 500		1 service sink

										buildings for

								A-2d		similar purposes

										Restaurants,

										banquet halls		1 per 75		1 per 75		1 per 200				—		1 per 500		1 service sink

										and food courts

										Auditoriums

										without

										permanent

										seating, art

										galleries,		1 per 125		1 per 65		1 per 200				—		1 per 500		1 service sink

										exhibition halls,

										museums,

										lecture halls,

						Assembly				libraries, arcades

				1		(see Sections		A-3d		and gymnasiums

						2902.2, 2902.4				Passenger

						and 2902.4.1)				terminals and

										transportation		1 per 500		1 per 500		1 per 750				—		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

										facilities

										Places of

										worship and

										other religious		1 per 150		1 per 75		1 per 200				—		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

										services

										Coliseums,		1 per 75 for		1 per 40 for

										arenas, skating		the first		the first

										rinks, pools and		1,500 and		1,500 and

								A-4		tennis courts for		1 per 120		1 per 60

										indoor sporting		for the		for the		1 per 200		1 per 150		—		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

										events and		remainder		remainder

										activities		exceeding		exceeding

												1,500		1,500

										Stadiums,		1 per 75 for		1 per 40 for

										amusement		the first		the first

										parks, bleachers		1,500 and		1,500 and

										and grandstands		1 per 120		1 per 60

								A-5		for outdoor		for the		for the		1 per 200		1 per 150		—		1 per 1,000

										sporting events		remainder		remainder										1 service sink

										and activities		exceeding		exceeding

												1,500		1,500





IBC 2902.1 - 2

		

				No.		CLASSIFICATION		OCCUPANCY		DESCRIPTION		WATER CLOSETS e				LAVATORIES								OTHER

												(URINALS SEE SECTION

												419.2 OF THE										DRINKING FOUNTAINS f

												INTERNATIONAL										(SEE SECTION 410.1

												PLUMBING CODE)										OF THE

												MALE		FEMALE		MALE		FEMALE		BATHTUBS/		INTERNATIONAL

																				SHOWERS		PLUMBING CODE)

										Buildings for

										the transaction

										of business,

										professional

						Business (see				services, other		1 per 25 for the first 50				1 per 40 for the first

				2		Sections 2902.2,		B		services		and 1 per 50 for the				80 and 1 per 80 for				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

						2902.4 and				involving		remainder exceeding 50				the remainder

						2902.4.1)				merchandise,						exceeding 80

										office buildings,

										banks, light

										industrial and

										similar uses

										Educational

				3		Educational		E		facilities		1 per 50				1 per 50				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

										Structures in

										which

										occupants are

										engaged in										See Section

				4		Factory and		F-1 and F-2		work		1 per 100				1 per 100				411 of the		1 per 400		1 service sink

						industrial				fabricating,										International

										assembly or										Plumbing

										processing of										Code

										products or										footnote g

										materials

										Residential

								I-1		care		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

										Hospitals,

										ambulatory

										nursing home		1 per per room c				1 per per room c				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

										patients b

										Employees,

								I-2		other than

										residential		1 per 25				1 per 35				—		1 per 100		—

										care b

				5		Institutional				Visitors, other

										than residential		1 per 75				1 per 100				—		1 per 500		—

										care

								I-3		Prisons b		1 per cell				1 per cell				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

										Reformatories,

										detention

								I-3		centers and		1 per 15				1 per 15				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

										correctional

										centers b

										Adult day care

								I-4		and child care		1 per 15				1 per 15				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

										Retail stores,

										service

						Mercantile (see				stations, shops

				6		Section 2902.2,		M		salesrooms,		1 per 500				1 per 750				—		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

						2902.4, 2902.4.1				markets and

						and 2902.4.2)				shopping

										centers

										Hotels, motels,

										boarding										1 per sleeping

								R-1		houses		1 per sleeping unit				1 per sleeping unit				unit		—		1 service sink

										(transient)

										Dormitories,

										fraternities,

								R-2		sororities and		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

										boarding house

				7		Residential				(not transient)

																								1 kitchen sink

																								per dwelling

																								unit; 1

																								automatic

								R-2		Apartment		1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling		—		clothes

										house										unit				washer

																								connection

																								per 20

																								dwelling units





IBC 2902.1 - 3

		

				No.		CLASSIFICATION		OCCUPANCY		DESCRIPTION		WATER CLOSETS e				LAVATORIES								OTHER

												(URINALS SEE SECTION

												419.2 OF THE										DRINKING FOUNTAINS f

												INTERNATIONAL										(SEE SECTION 410.1

												PLUMBING CODE)										OF THE

												MALE		FEMALE		MALE		FEMALE		BATHTUBS/		INTERNATIONAL

																				SHOWERS		PLUMBING CODE)

																								1 kitchen sink

																								per dwelling

																								unit; 1

										One- and														automatic

								R-3		two-family		1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling		—		clothes

										dwellings										unit				washer

				7		Residential																		connection

																								per 20

																								dwelling units

										Residential

								R-4		care/assisted		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

										living facilities

										Structures for

										the storage of

						Storage (see				goods,										See Section

						Sections 2902.2,		S-1		warehouses,										411 of the

				8		2902.4 and		S-2		storehouses		1 per 100				1 per 100				International		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

						2902.4.1)				and freight										Plumbing

										depots, low										Code

										and moderate										footnote g

										hazard

				a. The fixtures shown are based on one fixture being the minimum required for the number of persons indicated or any fraction of the number of persons indicated. The number of

				occupants shall be determined by this code.

				b. Toilet facilities for employees shall be separate from facilities for inmates or patients.

				c. A single-occupant toilet room with one water closet and one lavatory serving not more than two adjacent patient rooms shall be permitted where such room is provided with direct

				access from each patient room and with provisions for privacy.

				d. The occupant load for seasonal outdoor seating and entertainment areas shall be included when determining the minimum number of facilities required.

				e. In each bathroom or toilet room, urinals shall not be substituted for more than 67 percent of the required water closets in assembly and educational occupancies. Urinals shall not be

				substituted for more than 50 percent of the required water closets in all other occupancies

				f. Drinking fountains shall conform to ASME A112.19.1M, ASME A112.19.2M or ASME A112.19.9M and water coolers shall conform to ARI 1010. Drinking fountains and water coolers

				shall conform to NSF 61, Section 9. Where water is served in restaurants, drinking fountains shall not be required. In other occupancies, where drinking fountains are required,

				water coolers or bottled water dispensers shall be permitted to be substituted for not more than 50 percent of the required drinking fountains.

				g. Emergency showers and eyewash stations shall conform to ISEA Z358.1. Waste connections shall not be required for emergency showers and eyewash stations.





IPC 605.3

		

				TABLE 605.3

				WATER SERVICE PIPE

				MATERIAL		STANDARD

				Acrylonitrile butadiene styrene (ABS) plastic pipe		ASTM D 1527; ASTM D 2282

				Asbestos-cement pipe		ASTM C 296

				Brass pipe		ASTM B 43

				Chlorinated polyvinyl chloride (CPVC) plastic pipe		ASTM D 2846; ASTM F 441; ASTM F 442; CSA B137.6

				Copper or copper-alloy pipe		ASTM B 42; ASTM B 302

				Copper or copper-alloy tubing (Type K, WK, L, WL, M or		ASTM B 75; ASTM B 88; ASTM B 251; ASTM B 447

				WM)

				Cross-linked polyethylene (PEX) plastic pipe and tubing		ASTM F 876; ASTM F 877; AWWA C904; CSA B137.5

				Cross-linked polyethylene/aluminum/cross-linked		ASTM F 1281; CSA B137.10M

				polyethylene  (PEX-AL-PEX) pipe

				Cross-linked polyethylene/aluminum/high-density		ASTM F 1986

				polyethylene  (PEX-AL-HDPE)

				Ductile iron water pipe		AWWA C151; AWWA C115

				Galvanized steel pipe		ASTM A 53

				Polyethylene (PE) plastic pipea		ASTM D 2239; ASTM D 3035; AWWA C901; CSA B137.1

				Polyethylene (PE) plastic tubinga		ASTM D 2737; AWWA C901; CSA B137.1

				Polyethylene/aluminum/polethylene (PE-AL-PE) pipea		ASTM F 1282; CSA B137.9

				Polyethylene of raisedtemperature (PE-RT) plastic tubing		ASTM F 2769

				Polypropylene (PP) plastic pipe or tubing		ASTM F 2389; CSA B137.11

				Polyvinyl chloride (PVC) plastic pipea		ASTM D 1785; ASTM D 2241; ASTM D 2672; CSA

						B137.3

				Stainless steel pipe (Type 304/304L)		ASTM A 312; ASTM A 778

				Stainless steel pipe (Type 316/316L)		ASTM A 312; ASTM A 778

				a. Limited to the retrofitting of an existing lawn irrigation system, which was installed prior to August 1, 1992.





Sheet3

		





Sheet1

		






_1415700845.xls
permit fee schedule

		

				2007 Permit Fee Schedule

				TOTAL VALUATION		FEE

				$1 to $500		$22.32

				$501 to $2,000		$22.32 for the first $500 plus 2.89 for each additional $100

						or fraction thereof, to and including $2,000

				$2,001 to $25,000		$65.78 for the first $2,000 plus $13.30 for each additional

						$1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including $25,000

				$25,001 to $50,000		$371.68 for the first $25,000 plus $9.59 for each additional

						$1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000

				$50,001 to $100,000		$611.56 for the first $50,000 plus $6.65 for each additional

						$1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including $100,000

				$100,001 to $500,000		$944.06 for the first $100,000 plus $5.32 for each additional

						$1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including $500,000

				$500,001 to $1,000,000		$3,072.06 for the first $500,000 plus $4.51 for each

						additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including

						$1,000,000

				$1,000,001 to $5,000,000		$5328.31 for the first $1,000,000 plus $2.99 for each

						additiohnal $1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including

						$5,000,000

				$5,000,001 to $15,000,000		$17,081.87 for the first $5,000,000 plus $1.46 for each

						additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including

						$15,000,000

				$15,000,001 and above		$31,884.18 for the first $15,000,000 plus $0.96 for each

						additional $1,000 or fraction thereof

				Other Inspections and Fees:

				(1) Inspections outside of normal business hours (minimum charges - two hours)            $47.00 per hour*

				(2) Re-inspection fees when assessed by the building official under the                          $47.00 per hour*

				provisions of Section 108.8

				(3) Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated (minimum charge -                      $47.00 per hour*

				one-half hour)

				(4) Additional plan review required by changes, additions, or revisions to                        $47.00 per hour

				approved plans (minimum charge - one-half hour)

				(5) Residential Furnaces and Air Conditioners (Effective July 1st 2007)                            $65.00

				*Or the total hourly cost to the jurisdiction, whichever is the greatest. This cost shall include supervision,

				overhead, equipment, hourly wages and fringe benefits of the employees involved.





IBC 2902.1

		No.		CLASSIFICATION		OCCUPANCY		DESCRIPTION		WATER CLOSETS e				LAVATORIES								OTHER

										(URINALS SEE SECTION

										419.2 OF THE										DRINKING FOUNTAINS f

										INTERNATIONAL										(SEE SECTION 410.1

										PLUMBING CODE)										OF THE

										MALE		FEMALE		MALE		FEMALE		BATHTUBS/		INTERNATIONAL

																		SHOWERS		PLUMBING CODE)

								Theaters and

								other buildings

								for the

						A-1d		performing arts		1 per 125		1 per 65		1 per 200				—		1 per 500		1 service sink

								and motion

								pictures

								Nightclubs, bars,

								taverns, dance

								halls and		1 per 40		1 per 40		1 per 75				—		1 per 500

								buildings for														1 service sink

						A-2d		similar purposes

								Restaurants,

								banquet halls		1 per 75		1 per 75		1 per 200				—		1 per 500

								and food courts

								Auditoriums

								without														1 service sink

								permanent

								seating, art

								galleries,		1 per 125		1 per 65		1 per 200				—		1 per 500

								exhibition halls,

								museums,

								lecture halls,														1 service sink

				Assembly				libraries, arcades

		1		(see Sections		A-3d		and gymnasiums

				2902.2, 2902.4				Passenger

				and 2902.4.1)				terminals and

								transportation		1 per 500		1 per 500		1 per 750				—		1 per 1,000

								facilities														1 service sink

								Places of

								worship and

								other religious		1 per 150		1 per 75		1 per 200				—		1 per 1,000

								services

								Coliseums,		1 per 75 for		1 per 40 for

								arenas, skating		the first		the first										1 service sink

								rinks, pools and		1,500 and		1,500 and

						A-4		tennis courts for		1 per 120		1 per 60

								indoor sporting		for the		for the		1 per 200		1 per 150		—		1 per 1,000

								events and		remainder		remainder

								activities		exceeding		exceeding

										1,500		1,500										1 service sink

								Stadiums,		1 per 75 for		1 per 40 for

								amusement		the first		the first

								parks, bleachers		1,500 and		1,500 and

								and grandstands		1 per 120		1 per 60

						A-5		for outdoor		for the		for the		1 per 200		1 per 150		—		1 per 1,000

								sporting events		remainder		remainder										1 service sink

								and activities		exceeding		exceeding

										1,500		1,500

								Buildings for

								the transaction

								of business,

								professional

				Business (see				services, other		1 per 25 for the first 50				1 per 40 for the first

		2		Sections 2902.2,		B		services		and 1 per 50 for the				80 and 1 per 80 for				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

				2902.4 and				involving		remainder exceeding 50				the remainder

				2902.4.1)				merchandise,						exceeding 80

								office buildings,

								banks, light

								industrial and

								similar uses

								Educational

		3		Educational		E		facilities		1 per 50				1 per 50				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

								Structures in

								which

								occupants are

								engaged in										See Section

		4		Factory and		F-1 and F-2		work		1 per 100				1 per 100				411 of the		1 per 400		1 service sink

				industrial				fabricating,										International

								assembly or										Plumbing

								processing of										Code

								products or										footnote g

								materials

								Residential

						I-1		care		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

								Hospitals,

								ambulatory

								nursing home		1 per per room c				1 per per room c				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

								patients b

								Employees,

						I-2		other than

								residential		1 per 25				1 per 35				—		1 per 100		—

								care b

		5		Institutional				Visitors, other

								than residential		1 per 75				1 per 100				—		1 per 500		—

								care

						I-3		Prisons b		1 per cell				1 per cell				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

								Reformatories,

								detention

						I-3		centers and		1 per 15				1 per 15				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

								correctional

								centers b

								Adult day care

						I-4		and child care		1 per 15				1 per 15				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

								Retail stores,

								service

				Mercantile (see				stations, shops

		6		Section 2902.2,		M		salesrooms,		1 per 500				1 per 750				—		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

				2902.4, 2902.4.1				markets and

				and 2902.4.2)				shopping

								centers

								Hotels, motels,

								boarding										1 per sleeping

						R-1		houses		1 per sleeping unit				1 per sleeping unit				unit		—		1 service sink

								(transient)

								Dormitories,

								fraternities,

						R-2		sororities and		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

								boarding house

		7		Residential				(not transient)

																						1 kitchen sink

																						per dwelling

																						unit; 1

																						automatic

						R-2		Apartment		1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling		—		clothes

								house										unit				washer

																						connection

																						per 20

																						dwelling units

																						1 kitchen sink

																						per dwelling

																						unit; 1

								One- and														automatic

						R-3		two-family		1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling		—		clothes

								dwellings										unit				washer

		7		Residential																		connection

																						per 20

																						dwelling units

								Residential

						R-4		care/assisted		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

								living facilities

								Structures for

								the storage of

				Storage (see				goods,										See Section

				Sections 2902.2,		S-1		warehouses,										411 of the

		8		2902.4 and		S-2		storehouses		1 per 100				1 per 100				International		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

				2902.4.1)				and freight										Plumbing

								depots, low										Code

								and moderate										footnote g

								hazard

		a.		The fixtures shown are based on one fixture being the minimum required for the number of persons indicated or any

				fraction of the number of persons indicated. The number of occupants shall be determined by this code.

		b.		Toilet facilities for employees shall be separate from facilities for inmates or patients.

		c.		A single-occupant toilet room with one water closet and one lavatory serving not more than two adjacent patient rooms

				shall be permitted where such room is provided with direct access from each patient room and with provisions for

				privacy.

		d.		The occupant load for seasonal outdoor seating and entertainment areas shall be included when determining the

				minimum number of facilities required.

		e.		In each bathroom or toilet room, urinals shall not be substituted for more than 67 percent of the required water closets

				in assembly and educational occupancies. Urinals shall not be substituted for more than 50 percent of the required water .

				closets in all other occupancies

		f.		Drinking fountains shall conform to ASME A112.19.1M, ASME A112.19.2M or ASME A112.19.9M and water coolers shall

				conform to ARI 1010. Drinking fountains and water coolers shall conform to NSF 61, Section 9. Where water is served in

				restaurants, drinking fountains shall not be required. In other occupancies, where drinking fountains are required, water coolers

				or bottled water dispensers shall be permitted to be substituted for not more than 50 percent of the required drinking fountains.

		g.		Emergency showers and eyewash stations shall conform to ISEA Z358.1. Waste connections shall not be required for emergency

				showers and eyewash stations.





IBC 2902.1 - 1

		

				No.		CLASSIFICATION		OCCUPANCY		DESCRIPTION		WATER CLOSETS e				LAVATORIES								OTHER

												(URINALS SEE SECTION

												419.2 OF THE										DRINKING FOUNTAINS f

												INTERNATIONAL										(SEE SECTION 410.1

												PLUMBING CODE)										OF THE

												MALE		FEMALE		MALE		FEMALE		BATHTUBS/		INTERNATIONAL

																				SHOWERS		PLUMBING CODE)

										Theaters and

										other buildings

										for the

								A-1d		performing arts		1 per 125		1 per 65		1 per 200				—		1 per 500		1 service sink

										and motion

										pictures

										Nightclubs, bars,

										taverns, dance

										halls and		1 per 40		1 per 40		1 per 75				—		1 per 500		1 service sink

										buildings for

								A-2d		similar purposes

										Restaurants,

										banquet halls		1 per 75		1 per 75		1 per 200				—		1 per 500		1 service sink

										and food courts

										Auditoriums

										without

										permanent

										seating, art

										galleries,		1 per 125		1 per 65		1 per 200				—		1 per 500		1 service sink

										exhibition halls,

										museums,

										lecture halls,

						Assembly				libraries, arcades

				1		(see Sections		A-3d		and gymnasiums

						2902.2, 2902.4				Passenger

						and 2902.4.1)				terminals and

										transportation		1 per 500		1 per 500		1 per 750				—		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

										facilities

										Places of

										worship and

										other religious		1 per 150		1 per 75		1 per 200				—		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

										services

										Coliseums,		1 per 75 for		1 per 40 for

										arenas, skating		the first		the first

										rinks, pools and		1,500 and		1,500 and

								A-4		tennis courts for		1 per 120		1 per 60

										indoor sporting		for the		for the		1 per 200		1 per 150		—		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

										events and		remainder		remainder

										activities		exceeding		exceeding

												1,500		1,500

										Stadiums,		1 per 75 for		1 per 40 for

										amusement		the first		the first

										parks, bleachers		1,500 and		1,500 and

										and grandstands		1 per 120		1 per 60

								A-5		for outdoor		for the		for the		1 per 200		1 per 150		—		1 per 1,000

										sporting events		remainder		remainder										1 service sink

										and activities		exceeding		exceeding

												1,500		1,500





IBC 2902.1 - 2

		

				No.		CLASSIFICATION		OCCUPANCY		DESCRIPTION		WATER CLOSETS e				LAVATORIES								OTHER

												(URINALS SEE SECTION

												419.2 OF THE										DRINKING FOUNTAINS f

												INTERNATIONAL										(SEE SECTION 410.1

												PLUMBING CODE)										OF THE

												MALE		FEMALE		MALE		FEMALE		BATHTUBS/		INTERNATIONAL

																				SHOWERS		PLUMBING CODE)

										Buildings for

										the transaction

										of business,

										professional

						Business (see				services, other		1 per 25 for the first 50				1 per 40 for the first

				2		Sections 2902.2,		B		services		and 1 per 50 for the				80 and 1 per 80 for				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

						2902.4 and				involving		remainder exceeding 50				the remainder

						2902.4.1)				merchandise,						exceeding 80

										office buildings,

										banks, light

										industrial and

										similar uses

										Educational

				3		Educational		E		facilities		1 per 50				1 per 50				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

										Structures in

										which

										occupants are

										engaged in										See Section

				4		Factory and		F-1 and F-2		work		1 per 100				1 per 100				411 of the		1 per 400		1 service sink

						industrial				fabricating,										International

										assembly or										Plumbing

										processing of										Code

										products or										footnote g

										materials

										Residential

								I-1		care		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

										Hospitals,

										ambulatory

										nursing home		1 per per room c				1 per per room c				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

										patients b

										Employees,

								I-2		other than

										residential		1 per 25				1 per 35				—		1 per 100		—

										care b

				5		Institutional				Visitors, other

										than residential		1 per 75				1 per 100				—		1 per 500		—

										care

								I-3		Prisons b		1 per cell				1 per cell				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

										Reformatories,

										detention

								I-3		centers and		1 per 15				1 per 15				1 per 15		1 per 100		1 service sink

										correctional

										centers b

										Adult day care

								I-4		and child care		1 per 15				1 per 15				—		1 per 100		1 service sink

										Retail stores,

										service

						Mercantile (see				stations, shops

				6		Section 2902.2,		M		salesrooms,		1 per 500				1 per 750				—		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

						2902.4, 2902.4.1				markets and

						and 2902.4.2)				shopping

										centers

										Hotels, motels,

										boarding										1 per sleeping

								R-1		houses		1 per sleeping unit				1 per sleeping unit				unit		—		1 service sink

										(transient)

										Dormitories,

										fraternities,

								R-2		sororities and		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

										boarding house

				7		Residential				(not transient)

																								1 kitchen sink

																								per dwelling

																								unit; 1

																								automatic

								R-2		Apartment		1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling		—		clothes

										house										unit				washer

																								connection

																								per 20

																								dwelling units





IBC 2902.1 - 3

		

				No.		CLASSIFICATION		OCCUPANCY		DESCRIPTION		WATER CLOSETS e				LAVATORIES								OTHER

												(URINALS SEE SECTION

												419.2 OF THE										DRINKING FOUNTAINS f

												INTERNATIONAL										(SEE SECTION 410.1

												PLUMBING CODE)										OF THE

												MALE		FEMALE		MALE		FEMALE		BATHTUBS/		INTERNATIONAL

																				SHOWERS		PLUMBING CODE)

																								1 kitchen sink

																								per dwelling

																								unit; 1

										One- and														automatic

								R-3		two-family		1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling unit				1 per dwelling		—		clothes

										dwellings										unit				washer

				7		Residential																		connection

																								per 20

																								dwelling units

										Residential

								R-4		care/assisted		1 per 10				1 per 10				1 per 8		1 per 100		1 service sink

										living facilities

										Structures for

										the storage of

						Storage (see				goods,										See Section

						Sections 2902.2,		S-1		warehouses,										411 of the

				8		2902.4 and		S-2		storehouses		1 per 100				1 per 100				International		1 per 1,000		1 service sink

						2902.4.1)				and freight										Plumbing

										depots, low										Code

										and moderate										footnote g

										hazard

				a. The fixtures shown are based on one fixture being the minimum required for the number of persons indicated or any fraction of the number of persons indicated. The number of

				occupants shall be determined by this code.

				b. Toilet facilities for employees shall be separate from facilities for inmates or patients.

				c. A single-occupant toilet room with one water closet and one lavatory serving not more than two adjacent patient rooms shall be permitted where such room is provided with direct

				access from each patient room and with provisions for privacy.

				d. The occupant load for seasonal outdoor seating and entertainment areas shall be included when determining the minimum number of facilities required.

				e. In each bathroom or toilet room, urinals shall not be substituted for more than 67 percent of the required water closets in assembly and educational occupancies. Urinals shall not be

				substituted for more than 50 percent of the required water closets in all other occupancies

				f. Drinking fountains shall conform to ASME A112.19.1M, ASME A112.19.2M or ASME A112.19.9M and water coolers shall conform to ARI 1010. Drinking fountains and water coolers

				shall conform to NSF 61, Section 9. Where water is served in restaurants, drinking fountains shall not be required. In other occupancies, where drinking fountains are required,

				water coolers or bottled water dispensers shall be permitted to be substituted for not more than 50 percent of the required drinking fountains.

				g. Emergency showers and eyewash stations shall conform to ISEA Z358.1. Waste connections shall not be required for emergency showers and eyewash stations.





IPC 605.3

		

				TABLE 605.3

				WATER SERVICE PIPE

				MATERIAL		STANDARD

				Acrylonitrile butadiene styrene (ABS) plastic pipe		ASTM D 1527; ASTM D 2282

				Asbestos-cement pipe		ASTM C 296

				Brass pipe		ASTM B 43

				Chlorinated polyvinyl chloride (CPVC) plastic pipea		ASTM D 2846; ASTM F 441; ASTM F 442; CSA B137.6

				Copper or copper-alloy pipe		ASTM B 42; ASTM B 302

				Copper or copper-alloy tubing (Type K, WK, L, WL, M or		ASTM B 75; ASTM B 88; ASTM B 251; ASTM B 447

				WM)

				Cross-linked polyethylene (PEX) plastic tubing		ASTM F 876; ASTM F 877; CSA B137.5

				Cross-linked polyethylene/aluminum/cross-linked		ASTM F 1281; CSA B137.10M

				polyethylene  (PEX-AL-PEX) pipe

				Cross-linked polyethylene/aluminum/high-density		ASTM F 1986

				polyethylene  (PEX-AL-HDPE)

				Ductile iron water pipe		AWWA C151; AWWA C115

				Galvanized steel pipe		ASTM A 53

				Polybutylene (PB) plastic pipe and tubing		ASTM D 2662; ASTM D 2666; ASTM D 3309; CSA

						B137.8M

				Polyethylene (PE) plastic pipea		ASTM D 2239; CSA B137.1

				Polyethylene (PE) plastic tubinga		ASTM D 2737; CSA B137.1

				Polyethylene/aluminum/polethylene (PE-AL-PE) pipea		ASTM F 1282; CSA B137.9

				Polypropylene (PP) plastic pipe or tubing		ASTM F 2389; CSA B137.11

				Polyvinyl chloride (PVC) plastic pipea		ASTM D 1785; ASTM D 2241; ASTM D 2672; CSA

						B137.3

				Stainless steel pipe (Type 304/304L)		ASTM A 312; ASTM A 778

				Stainless steel pipe (Type 316/316L)		ASTM A 312; ASTM A 778

				a. Limited to the retrofitting of an existing lawn irrigation system, which was installed prior to August 1, 1992.





Sheet3

		

				TABLE 605.4

				WATER DISTRIBUTION PIPE

				MATERIAL		STANDARD

				Brass pipe		ASTM B 43

				Chlorinated polyvinyl chloride (CPVC) plastic pipe and tubing		ASTM D 2846; ASTM F 441; ASTM F 442; CSA B137.6

				Copper or copper-alloy pipe		ASTM B 42; ASTM B 302

				Copper or copper-alloy tubing (Type K, WK, L, WL, M or WM)		ASTM B 75; ASTM B 88; ASTM B 251; ASTM B 447

				Cross-linked polyethylene (PEX) plastic tubing		ASTM F 876; ASTM F 877; CSA B137.5

				Cross-linked polyethylene/aluminum/cross-linked		ASTM F 1281; ASTM F 2262; CSA B137.10M

				polyethylene  (PEX-AL-PEX) pipe

				Cross-linked polyethylene/aluminum/high-density		ASTM F 1986

				polyethylene  (PEX-AL-HDPE)

				Ductile iron pipe		AWWA C151/A21.51; AWWAC115/A21.15

				Galvanized steel pipe		ASTM A 53

				Polyethylene/aluminum/polethylene (PE-AL-PE) composite pipe		ASTM F 1282

				Polyethylene of raised temperature (PE-RT) plastic tubing		ASTM F 2769

				Polypropylene (PP) plastic pipe or tubing		ASTM F 2389; CSA B137.11

				Stainless steel pipe (Type 304/304L)		ASTM A 312; ASTM A 778

				Stainless steel pipe (Type 316/316L)		ASTM A 312; ASTM A 778





Sheet1

		






